o | Collin County
Going the Extra Mile (GEM) Recognition Form

Honoree's Name: Lee Howe

Honoree's Job Title: _ Environmental Deputy

Department: Sheriffs Office

Years of Service with the County: 2 years
Why the Honoree is receiving a GEM Award including dates:

On September 14, 2011 Deputy Howe noticed damage to County Road 424 and identified those

¥

responsible for the damage. He:noticed the incident as he performed his duties of en—

vironmental deputy. The observation and identification was in addition to his duties and

shows his care,:concern, and diligence as a county employee. Since the act was above and

beyond his daily duties I recommend him for "going the extra mile", and as a result saving

the county (tax payers) "thousands of dollors" in repairs. (see attached email)
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Mark Sanderson

From: Jon Kleinheksel

Sent: Thursday, September 15, 2011 2:24 PM

To: Lee Howe

Cc: Terry Box; Chuck Ruckel; Mark Sanderson

Subject: FW: CR 424- United Rentals damage

Attachments: CR 424 UR damage-1.jpg; CR 424 UR damage-2.jpg; CR 424 UR damage-3.jpg; CR 424 UR

damage-4.jpg; CR 424 UR damage-5.jpg; CR 424 UR damage-6.jpg; CR 424 UR
damage-7.jpg; CR 424 UR damage-8.jpg; CR 424 UR damage-9.jpg; CR 424 UR
damage-10.jpg

Lee™

{ truly appreciate your awareness and ultimately your willingness to assist in all aspects of Public Service. By recoghizing

and identifying
the road damage on CR 424, you have literally saved Public Works and ultimately Collin County thousands of dollars....

Again, | appreciate what you do and how you conduct yourself throughout Public Works, your professionalism and
positive attitude

are greatly appreciated..

Jon

From: Ronald Anderson

Sent: Thursday, September 15, 2011 11:39 AM
To: Gary Enna

Cc: Jon Kleinheksel

Subject: CR 424- United Rentals damage

Gary,

An employee of United Rentals damaged CR 424 with a piece of equipment. I will get the
repair scheduled as soon as possible. We are going to remove the damaged TCP, repair and re-
compact the area and reapply TCP. I have contacted United Rentals regarding the repair cost.

Pictures attached.
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Thank you,



K4

. Wayne Anderson
Collin County Public Works
Road and Bridge Superintendent
972-548-3710
randerson@co.colfin.tx.us
Public Works Website




